Beresford City Council

March 2, 2015
The Beresford City Council met in regular session in the City Library Community Room on March 2, 2015 at 7:30 p.m.

Members present: Mayor Jim Fedderson presiding, Gerald Dahlin, Tom Erickson, Gary Lambert, Art Schott, and Teresa Sveeggen.   

Also present: Jerry Zeimetz, City Administrator and Tom Frieberg, City Attorney.
Absent: Dan Williams. 
Adopt Agenda: A motion to adopt the agenda was made by Lambert, seconded by Sveeggen, motion carried.

Minutes: Dahlin made the motion to approve the February 17, 2015 Council Minutes seconded by Schott. All present Council Members voted aye, motion carried. 
Old Business
2nd Reading and adoption Ordinance 2014-05, Supplemental Appropriation Ordinance: Ordinance 2014-05 was given its 2nd reading and adopted on a motion by Erickson, seconded by Dahlin. Attorney Frieberg noted that the Ordinance number was incorrect. Erickson made the motion, seconded by Dahlin to amend the original motion to read Ordinance 2015-02. All present Council Members voted aye, motion carried. On the original motion, all present Council members voted aye, motion carried.  
New Business

Review bids for FEMA Storm Shelter/Bathhouse: Schott made the motion seconded by Sveeggen to accept GA Johnson Construction bid of $1,171,500.00 for the FEMA Storm Shelter/Bathhouse. All present Council Members voted aye, motion carried.
	2015 City of Beresford FEMA Storm Shelter bids
	
	
	

	 
	Ricchio, Inc.
	Daniels Residential Inc.
	GA Johnsons Const.
	Smart Commercial Const. Co.
	H. Van Voorst Concrete Inc.

	Contractor
	1017 Vista Dr.
	27160 470th Ave., Suite A
	3409 W. 47th St., Suite 101
	820 E. Amidon St.
	47886 US Hwy 18

	 
	Gurnee, IL  60031
	Tea, SD  57064
	Sioux Falls, SD  57106
	Sioux Falls, SD  57104
	Canton, SD  57013

	General Construction - Contract #1
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Base Bid - lump sum
	$1,119,000.00
	$910,000.00
	Combo Only
	$798,000.00
	No bid

	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	ALTERNATES
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Bid Alternate #1-1 (delete room 104, 108 & 109)
	-$120,000.00
	-$62,000.00
	-$75,000.00
	-$83,773.00
	 

	Bid Alternate #1-2 (ductless split system)
	$24,000.00
	$7,600.00
	$9,000.00
	$9,150.00
	 

	Bid Alternate #1-3 (resinous flooring)
	$38,000.00
	$31,400.00
	$31,000.00
	$38,580.00
	 

	Bid Alternate #1-4 (hp windows)
	$27,000.00
	$29,100.00
	$32,500.00
	$28,160.00
	 

	 


	
	
	
	
	 

	Excavation, Grading, Utilities Construction - Contract #2
	
	
	 

	Base Bid - lump sum
	$196,000.00
	No Bid
	Combo Only
	No Bid
	No Bid

	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	ALTERNATES
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Bid Alternate #2-1 (sidewalk)
	Add=$6.00  (Deduct=$6.00)
	 
	Add=$1.50 (Deduct=$1.50)
	 
	 

	Bid Alternate #2-2 (sub-base)
	Add=$50 (Deduct=$50)
	 
	Add=$13.50 (Deduct=$13.50)
	 
	 

	Bid Alternate #2-3 (granular matl-type A)
	Add=$50 (Deduct=$50)
	 
	Add=$13.00 (Deduct=$13.00)
	 
	 

	Bid Alternate #2-4 (concession wing)
	-$5,000.00
	 
	-$5,600.00
	 
	 

	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Site Concrete Construction - Contract #3
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Base Bid - Lump Sum
	$71,000.00
	No Bid
	Combo Only
	No Bid
	$45,300.00

	 
	
	
	
	
	 

	ALTERNATES
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Bid Alternate #3-1 (Sidewalk)
	Add-$6.00  (Deduct=$6.00)
	 
	Add= $4.50 (Deduct=$4.50)
	 
	Add=$3.65 (Deduct=$3.65)

	Bid Alternate #3-2 (sidewalk around concession)
	-$4,000.00
	 
	-$8,700.00
	 
	-$5,430.00

	 
	
	
	
	
	Base Bid Price includes:

	Combination Bidders Only
	 
	 
	 
	1) $3,000 for concrete tests

	General Constr. - Contract #1
	$1,119,000.00
	 
	Combo Only
	 
	2) Transformer concrete base

	Excavation, Grading, Utilities Constr - Contract #2
	$196,000.00
	 
	Combo Only
	 
	 and pipe bollards $3,950

	Site Concrete construction - Contract #3
	$71,000.00
	 
	Combo Only
	 
	Base Bid excludes:

	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	1) all light pole bases

	Amount Deducted if Awarded all
	$0.00
	 
	None
	 
	2) cost of all granular for under

	Contracts for Bids listed above
	 
	 
	 
	 
	curbs and sidewalks

	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Total Amount of Combination Bid
	$1,386,000.00
	 
	$1,099,000.00
	 
	 

	If Contractor only wants total
	Will accept Contract #1 by itself. 
	
	X
	
	 

	package that he/she submits bid
	Will accept Contracts #2 & #3 
	
	(excludes lockers deleted
	
	 

	for indicate here:
	only in combo with Contract #1
	 
	in specification manual)
	 
	 


Review bids for Crushed Gravel and Sub-Base Material: The following bids were received for the City’s 2015 Sub-base material and crushed gravel. Dahlin made the motion, seconded by Schott to approve the delivered and loaded low bid from Rechnagel Construction. All present Council Members voted aye, motion carried.





Delivered
Loaded

(1500T)
(1500T)





Price

Price

Total Cost
Total Cost





Per Ton

Per Ton

Delivered
at Pit

Rechnagel Construction

$9.30

$3.85

$13,950.00
$5,775.00
Concrete Materials 

$9.65

$3.90

$14,475.00
$5,850.00
Review bids for Asphalt Surface Treatment Project: The following bids were received for the City’s 2015 asphalt surface treatment. Lambert made the motion to approve the low bid from Topkote Inc. Sveeggen seconded the motion. All present Council members voted aye, motion carried. 





(65 T)

(600 T)

(65 T)

(600 T)



MC 800

Type 2A

MC 800

Type 2A



Asphalt

Aggregate
Asphalt

Aggregate
Total

Per Ton

Per Ton

Amount

Amount

Bid

Topkote Inc.


$732.10

$23.215

$47,856.50
$18,752.00
$66,158.20

The Road Guy


$800.00

$19.25

$52,000.00
$15,400.00
$67,400.00

Asphalt Surfacing Co.

$865.00

$29.00

$56,225.00
$23,200.00
$79,425.00
Review wages for P/T Police Officers: Erickson made the motion to change the part time police officers base pay to $16.00/hr. Lambert seconded the motion, all present Council Members voted aye, motion carried.
P/T Police Officer Hires: Lambert made the motion to approve hiring part time police officer Kaven Swearingen at $16.00/hr. Schott seconded the motion; all present Council Members voted aye, motion carried. 
Authorize purchase of Dodge Ram 1500 Special Service Vehicle off SD State Bid for Police Dept.: Erickson made the motion, seconded by Schott to authorize the purchase of the Dodge Ram 1500 vehicle for the Police Dept. in the amount of $25,578.00 off of the South Dakota State bid. All present Council Members voted aye, motion carried.
Authorize purchase of Ford F250 Super Duty vehicle off SD State Bid for Public Works Dept.: Lambert made the motion, seconded by Dahlin to authorize the budgeted purchase of a Ford F250 Super Duty pickup off the SD State bid for the Street Dept. in the amount of $25,083.00 off of the South Dakota State bid. All present Council Members voted aye, motion carried.
Authorization to advertise for bids for a new loader/backhoe: Dahlin authorized advertising for bids for a new loader/backhoe. Erickson seconded, all present Council Members voted aye, motion carried. 
Discussion & Information Items

City Wide Cleanup: Council discussed a City wide cleanup and decided that they would offer 2 weeks free dumping at the Rubble Site to Beresford residents only. Council will discuss dates at the next council meeting. 
SD America’s Farmers Grow Communities Donation: Mayor and Council thanked rural Beresford resident Chad Hazel for the $2,500.00 donation from SD America’s Farmers Grow Communities Monsanto fund to be used for the swimming pool.
Local Board of Equalization meets March 16, 2015: The local board of equalization will meet at the Beresford Community Library on Monday March 16, 2015 at 7:30 p.m. The purpose of the meeting is to review any objections Beresford residents may have to the counties assessment of their property. Individuals wishing to appeal will have until 5pm on Thursday March 12th, 2015 to submit their written request.
Municipal Election: A City election will not be held this year. Incumbent Council Members Ward 1 Art Schott, Ward 2 Gerald Dahlin and Ward 3 Tom Erickson will hold another 2 year term. 
Approval of Travel Requests:

A motion to approve the following travel requests was made by Lambert seconded by Schott. All present Council Members voted aye, motion carried.


SD Police Chiefs Spring Conference, Deadwood, April 21-24, Christensen


SD Building Officials Training Conference, Sioux Falls, March 26, Fillingsness
Payment of Bills:
A motion was made by Sveeggen seconded by Erickson to approve payment of the bills listed below, motion carried.

Aaron’s Pro Window Cleaning, service, $35.00; Baker & Taylor, books, $488.46; Barnes & Noble, books, $111.16; Beal Distributing, Beer, $5,320.51; Beresford Cablevision, billing, $356.50; Beresford Municipal Telephone, billing, $3,573.84; Beresford Municipal Utilities, billing, $13,127.47; Beresford Republic, publishing’s, $352.29; Border States Electric, street light supplies, $5,946.09; Brown & Saenger, paper, $289.95; Burbach Aquatics, engineering, $11,942.57; CenturyLink, toll settlement, $136.76; Chesterman, resale, $261.28; Dakota Beverage, beer, $3,438.10; DakotaCare, health insurance, $31,262.20; 

First National Bank of Sioux Falls, DW & DW SRG, $16,130.12; Hansen, Dan, camera sewer line, $270.00; E-Conolight, lights, $379.98; Erickson Htg & A/C, furnace, $2,081.62; Fastenal Company, supplies, $14.08; Follett School Solutions, software, $1,000.00;

Fresco, light post, $345.10; Frieberg Nelson Ask, retainer, $1,423.75; Frontier Precision, training, $1,100.00; Gale/Cengage Learning, books, $182.33; Hansen, Todd, meals, $108.00; Heavenly Accent by Faith, clothing, $50.00; Intense Graphics, advertising, $40.00;

Jack’s Uniforms & Equipment, clothing allowance, $107.94; Jacobson, Dean, switch meeting, $60.95; 

Johnson Brothers, liquor, $1,429.34; Knudson, Delmar, 1975 Dodge D600, $2,300.00; Lamb Motor Company, 2015 Ford F250 Super Duty V8, $25,083.00; Loren Fischer Disposal, service, $4,968.00; MidAmerican Energy, natural gas, $3,082.60; Midwest Tape, DVD’s, $623.75; Midwest Turf & Irrigation, repair, $27.79; Muller Auto Parts, repair, $1,284.04; Olson’s Ace Hardware, supplies, $779.15;

Papa Murphy’s Pizza, resale, $235.80; Perkins Office Solutions, office chairs, $1,005.94; Pitney Bowes, postage, $3,030.00; Printing Plus, forms, $300.00; Queen City Wholesale, supplies, $769.37; Republic National Distributing, liquor, $5,398.42; 

Sanford Health, vaccine, $114.00; SD Bldg. Officials Assn, registration fee, $75.00; SD Dept. of Health, lab fees, $30.00; SD Division of Motor Vehicles, title & registration, $20.00; SD Sheriff’s Association, registration fee, $85.00; SD Supplemental, retirement, $2,760.00;

SDN Communications, maintenance agreement, $1,130.64; Sheehan Mack Sales, 2014 Volvo L60G, $1,300.00; Smart Apple Media, books, $378.32; Stan Houston Equip, core drill, $2,279.00; The Country Club, used range balls, $600.00; Titan Machinery, spring, $11.00; Toshiba Financial Services, copier lease, $236.99; USAC, schools & libraries, $4,323.11; Vantage Point, CALEA, $160.00;
Variety Foods, food, $1,874.78; Verizon Wireless, service, $1,044.73; Walt’s Homestyle Foods, resale, $103.50; WESCO Distribution, meters, $4,207.00; Zabel Steel, repairs, $119.50; Zeimetz, Jerry, mileage allowance, $300.00.

Executive Session – personnel: At 8:07 p.m. Dahlin made the motion to go into executive session for a personnel issue. Lambert seconded the motion, all present Council Members voted aye, motion carried.

Council reconvened at 8:45 p.m. No action taken.
Adjournment: As there was no further business, the meeting adjourned at 8:46 p.m. on a motion by Erickson, seconded by Sveeggen. All present Council Members voted aye, motion carried. 







_____________________________________







Kathy Moller, Finance Officer


 






Recorded by Elaine Johnson
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